
 
 

    Board Minutes 
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Date Wednesday,  1 July 2020 

Time 5:30pm 

Apologies  Jane, Chris, Awa, Andi 

Agenda Item  Minutes Actions 

Welcome  
  

Apologies 
Jane, Chris, Awa, Andi  

Conflict of interest 
None  

Previous Minutes 
Approved  

P&C Update 
 
 

P&C met on 18/6. 
 
P&C keen to put additional 
fundraising money and energies 
to revitalising all play areas 
across the school. Looking at a 
subcommittee to oversee this. 
Keen to get student voice and 
KD will organise this. 
 
10K Covid stimulus – P&C to 
seek ideas from school. KD 
suggested towards the ECE 
playground. 
 
Recycling Scheme – voted to 
proceed 
 
Parking issues raised and 
discussed. 
 
Future events include Cookie 
Dough f/r, School disco, Father’s 
Day stall, Food wrap f/r, Parent 
Quiz night. 
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Canteen – Term 3 
 

Submissions from Crust, Libby’s 
kitchen (JCCA), Happy lunch box 
(Freo primary), Rima 
 
Rima successful but needs to 
utilise kitchen space. 
 
P&C donating equipment to the 
school 

 Audit of food 
 

 

Community representative/s 
 

Voting for parent reps 
underway – via email survey 
with unique codes 
 
Discussion around community 
representatives: 

 Tom Gourlay (NDU) 

 Joan Jessup (Just Manna) 

 Maureen Toyn (North 
metro tafe) 

 Wirrpanda foundation 
Discussed need to align needs of 
the school with community 
representation. Decided to 
accept Joan Jessup and to look 
at all other alternatives before 
deciding on other rep. 
Possibility of approaching 
Fremantle College AIEO for 
contacts. 

Invite Joan to be a 
community 
representative 
 
Seek more 
information 
regarding Wirrpanda 
Foundation and 
North Metro Tafe 
candidate. 
 
Follow up with 
Fremantle College 
AIEO. 

 Semester 1, 2020 Reporting to 
Parents 
 

Provided guidance from DOE 
 
Worked with staff to determine 
BPS context 
 
Developed Sem 1 Reporting 
guidelines 
 
Parents will receive a cover 
letter to outline this 

 

Rottnest and IEC updates 
 

Alternative attendance 
arrangement in place for long 
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Meeting closed at 645pm. Next meeting 12 August. 

term holiday children on 
Rottnest. Two children will be 
attending for Term 3 
 
Impact of COVID on migration 
and IEC being looked at by 
Statewide Services and DOE. 

General Business 
 
 
 

  


